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The Philippine Journal of Allied Health Sciences 
(PJAHS) and our publisher, the College of 
Rehabilitation Sciences of the University of Santo 
Tomas, extend our deepest gratitude to our 
editorial board, academic editors, and reviewers. 
They have graciously contributed to the journal’s 
peer-review process for the years 2020-2021. 
We recognize your selfless contribution in 
support of our aim to further research in the field 
of allied health science through the 
democratization of knowledge evidence by way 
of Open Access journals such as PJAHS.  

The names of the individual editorial board 
members, staff, academic editors, and reviewers 
who performed excellent peer-review on the 
submitted manuscripts, some of which appear in 
this edition, appear in the supplementary file 
S1_PJAHS_List_2021. Your participation in the 
review process is duly recognized and 
appreciated. Thank you for embarking with us in 
this journey of informing and influencing allied 
health science clinical and research practice. We 
hope that our partnership continues to flourish 
and prosper in the future editions of PJAHS. 
Maraming Salamat po! 
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https://drive.google.com/file/d/1JReVnRHC5f2WQxAwy4StlaZtrl_9mSul/view?usp=sharing

