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Abstract 

Occupational Therapy (OT) is a profession that is not easily understood, leading to limited appreciation and misunderstanding of its therapeutic 
scope and areas of concern. The BOAT Model was created to guide therapists in establishing a therapeutic alliance with clients for the purpose of 
eliciting mutual concern, perception, and understanding of the client’s unique occupational performance issues (OPI). The model also aims to help 
enhance the appreciation for OT services. Two specific steps were provided as a process in achieving the outcomes stated, namely Establish and 
Converse. The use of appropriate therapeutic interactive styles and modes outlined in the IRM were incorporated into the model. At the end of the 
process, the identified OPI using the COPM will be used to advise the creation of an occupation-based evaluation and intervention that is more 
relevant and meaningful for the client. 
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INTRODUCTION 

Occupational therapy is a profession that 
requires collaboration between the client and 
the therapist. However, such opportunities for 
collaboration are often not optimized since many 
clients have a limited understanding and 
appreciation of the meaning of occupation. There 
is a general lack of knowledge and awareness 
about OT. 1,2 The profession had been described 
as vague among the public,1, 3 and average at best 
amongst healthcare workers.1,4,5 The level of 
knowledge of clients about OT affects their 
expectations and acceptance of OT services. The 
lack of awareness of OT services caused 
therapists to alter their treatment plans to 
enable clients to overcome issues related to 
denial, over or under expectations, or lack of 
acceptance of OT services.1 In goal setting, 
therapists may even risk a mismatch of goals and 
expectations towards the focus of therapy if they 

fail to practice client involvement and shared 
decision making.6 As such, Occupational 
Therapists (OTs) have the responsibility of 
fostering a collaborative relationship with clients 
to communicate the scope of intervention 
possibilities and build mutual understanding and 
perspective with the client in enhancing 
occupational performance. 

Occupational performance is the 
“accomplishment of the selected occupation 
resulting from the dynamic transaction among 
the client, their contexts, and the occupation”.7 
Before the intervention, the OT and the client 
need to identify OPI that interfere with the 
client’s overall participation and engagement. 
OPIs are problems that arise when individuals 
have dysfunction in their ability to choose, 
organize, and adequately perform relevant 
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occupations.8 Identification of OPIs with clients 
is vital to the initial stages of the OT process. In 
directing the narrative around the client’s 
perceived OPI when first meeting clients, the 
therapist communicates the purpose of OT to 
their clients in the process.9 Moreover, therapists 
become responsible for enhancing opportunities 
for the client to be more engaged in therapeutic 
decision-making with increased perception and 
understanding of their lived experiences as 
occupational beings.9 

 

DEVELOPMENTAL PROCESS 

The conceptual framework was developed when 
the researchers found a clinical roadblock 
experienced in practice, specifically the client’s 
difficulty identifying OPI due to a lack of 
knowledge and appreciation about OT as a 
profession.  

The researchers reviewed articles on potential 
consequences that could reverberate throughout 
the therapeutic management if the OTs failed to 
sufficiently explain their own professional 
identity and focus on OPI before any underlying 
factors that may have contributed to the 
occupational problem. Client dissatisfaction with 
services, blurring of professional identity, and 
failure to address the OPI relevant to the client’s 
daily context were possible consequences in 
failing to focus on occupation-based assessments 
directly.10 This prompted the researchers to 
create a conceptual model that will guide 
therapists in setting the stage and in creating a 
therapeutic alliance for the purpose of enhancing 
their clients' understanding of OT services as 
agents that address occupational performance 
problems. Published journals and articles that 
focused on client-therapist collaboration and 
articles on how to elicit discussion on 
occupational performance problems through 
therapist’s skills and strategies were studied. 

Therefore, the model would focus on setting the 
stage in creating a therapeutic alliance with the 
client and providing direction to arrive at a 
mutual understanding and prioritization of the 
client’s occupation-focused issues and a deeper 
appreciation for OT services at its conclusion. All 
information gathered will aid the therapist in 

creating a meaningful, individualized, and 
collaborative OT formal evaluation with the 
client. 

 

THEORETICAL BASES 

Canadian Practice Process Framework (CPPF) 
and Intentional Relationship Model (IRM) were 
key conceptual frameworks and models used to 
develop the BOAT Model.  

CPPF. The general process of the BOAT model is 
derived from the Canadian Practice Process 
Framework (CPPF).8 The framework determines 
the steps in achieving a client's understanding of 
OT, identifying occupational performance issues, 
and acknowledging the contextual factors 
surrounding the therapeutic process. The 
development of the BOAT model focused only on 
the first two key actions that compromises the 
eight key actions proposed in the CPPF. These 
essential steps include (1) enter/initiate and (2) 
set the stage.11 Enter/initiate is the process of 
screening the client upon referral to OT and 
identifying their background. This is in 
preparation for building rapport with the client, 
leading to a harmonious and cooperative 
relationship. Here, the therapist establishes 
contact with the client for the first time and sets 
the stage for their future interactions throughout 
the OT process. Set the stage is focused on 
understanding the client and their occupational 
challenges. It entails determining aspects of the 
context and environment that can hinder or 
support their occupational engagement. The first 
two stages prepare the client to enter the 
therapy process officially and for them to 
express their consent to avail of OT intervention.  

The elements of CPPF also include the societal 
context and practice context, which influence the 
overall therapeutic process.8 The practice 
context corresponds to the factors that the client 
and therapist have that shape their interactions 
embedded in a wider societal context. The 
societal context encompasses both the client’s 
and therapist’s institutional, cultural, physical, 
and social environment. The contexts mentioned 
above highlight the interaction and relationship 
of the therapist and client in therapy.
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IRM. The Intentional Relationship Model 
explains the relationship between the client and 
the therapist as one potential precondition for 
the client’s engagement in the OT process.12 The 
intentional use of the therapeutic relationship 
includes the therapist’s consideration of 
appropriate responses to interpersonal events 
occurring in therapy. It is important for the 
therapist to develop interpersonal skills to build 
a therapeutic alliance and use appropriate 
communication styles that best support the 
client’s occupational needs. Therapists must 
consider the clients’ unique interpersonal 
characteristics and the preferred ways of 
interacting during therapeutic mode selection.13 
The ultimate goal of IRM is to help therapists 
improve their relationships with clients, as this 
can help them provide their assistance to clients 
more effectively. 

 

CONCEPTUAL MODEL  

Building Occupational Alliance for Therapy 
(BOAT) Model 

1. Boat 

The boat represents the therapeutic alliance 
between the therapist, client, family, and others. 
The boat symbolizes the intentional relationship 
that is formed between the therapist and the 
client. Collaboration has been defined as 
“working together towards a common goal.”14 
This is necessary for shared decision-making and 
mutual focus on identifying occupational 
performance concerns. The boat direction is 
affected by the sailors controlling the boat, and 
the winds and currents represent external 
elements that affect occupational performance. It 
is essential to consider all these factors to keep 
the boat sailing in the right direction.  

2. Sailors 

The sailors represent both the occupational 
therapist and the client. The occupational 
therapist is the technical expert that clients 
consult for their professional knowledge.15 The 
therapist's role is to guide, actively listen, and 
understand the clients' individuality. Their main 
objective is to prioritize the clients’ needs and 
wants to achieve success.16,17 Through this 
relationship, therapists and clients work 

together to achieve client-centered practice. The 
therapist must empower clients to appreciate 
themselves as occupational beings that are fully 
capable of self-determination.  

For the purpose of this paper, the client would be 
defined as the actual client, their family, and 
others that are included within the therapeutic 
process. The client is a unique occupational 
being that holds a valid and important source for 
therapeutic goal setting. In a client-centered 
practice, clients are thought of as having the 
capability to choose their own goals and have the 
right to make their own choices in therapy. 

Balanced teamwork among the sailors is 
important to keep the boat sailing in the right 
direction towards the island, representing the 
successful identification of OPI arising from a 
shared-decision making and collaboration 
process between the client and the therapist in 
the determination of occupation-based 
outcomes. The sailors hold their own insights, 
attitudes, beliefs, culture, and capabilities that 
can potentially influence each other. If the 
therapist dominates the decision-making process 
as the “expert” and maneuvers the sail 
notwithstanding the client’s input, the boat may 
veer away from the desired destination.  

3. Winds and Currents 

The concepts behind the winds and sea currents 
were adapted from the CPPF “societal and 
practice context” that affect the collaboration 
and process of OT for both the client and 
therapist. These contexts can either be 
considered a facilitator or barrier towards 
obtaining clients' appreciation and 
understanding of the scope of OT. The wind 
represents the societal context of both the 
therapist and the client. This context 
encompasses both the client’s and therapist’s 
institutional, cultural, physical, and social 
environment. The currents represent the practice 
context and conditions of the existing OT 
transaction.  

4. Buoys 

The buoys represent the steps that will guide OT 
practitioners in facilitating OPI identification and 
a greater appreciation of OT for clients. 

Establish Rapport and Knowledge of OT. The 
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first step is to establish OT knowledge and build 
rapport with the client1. Therapists may probe 
for specific information about the client’s 
knowledge of OT to highlight the depth of the 
clients’ understanding of the profession at the 
start of the meeting. The therapist would also 
need to define occupational performance to the 
client so they are oriented towards the focus of 

OT services. In employing this process, clients in 
effect obtain critical information that will help 
them decide to pursue therapeutic services or 
not11. It is also recommended to build trust with 
clients first before trying to probe for the client’s 
OPI, as the likelihood of disclosure increases 
when clients feel they can trust their therapists 
enough.

 

 
Figure 1. Building Occupational Alliance for Therapy (BOAT) Model 

 

 

At this point, the therapist would then need to 
identify and account for the possible barriers and 
facilitators between the client, the therapist, and 
the context that would potentially affect their 
therapeutic alliance and collaboration. The 
therapist would then use their clinical reasoning 
skills to determine appropriate interactive styles 
and modes from the IRM that will be utilized. 
The choice of strategies shall be dependent on 
what is needed by the client and therapist to 
enhance their relationship and consequently 

foster enhanced trust, disclosure, and confidence 
on the client’s part to prepare them for 
eventually conversing about their OPIs with the 
therapist in the next buoy. 

The encouraging mode will be used to foster 
hope and willingness to engage in collaboration 
with the therapist in starting the therapeutic 
process. The problem-solving mode will be used 
to facilitate reasoning and employ strategic 
questions to identify solutions for potential 
issues in collaboration or identification of OPIs. 
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Finally, the instructing mode will be used in 
providing clear expectations and explanations 
about OT scope should the therapist identify 
lacking information that impedes effective 
discussion for OPI identification. 

At the end of this stage, the therapist, client, 
family, and others will have a mutual 
understanding and clear expectations from each 
other to be able to work together in the future 
effectively. The therapist’s communication style, 
interpersonal skills, and choice of therapeutic 
modes18 will help overcome the barriers to 
client-centered care and will aid in educating the 
client about the OT process, develop trust, 
discover and rediscover aspirations and instill 
awareness of occupational possibilities. 

Converse about OPI. In this step, the therapist 
and client will now have a discourse on the 
client’s OPI to formulate the occupational profile. 
At this stage, the therapist shall be assuming a 
collaborating mode to help the client facilitate 
ownership of their own OPIs and utilize the 
empathizing mode to understand and validate 
what the clients will share on their lived 
experiences. 

The Canadian Occupational Performance 
Measure (COPM) will be used to enable the 
active participation of the client in defining OPI. 
This tool will also facilitate a goal-setting process 
in a client-centered approach. Furthermore, the 
COPM interview may influence the client’s 
understanding of their problems which 
facilitates a process of self-awareness and may 
also influence the therapy outcomes.19 From the 
gathered information, OTs will be able to 
develop a working hypothesis regarding the 
reasons and challenges behind the client’s OPI.  

At the end of this stage, the therapist 
summarizes all the findings and gives relevant 
information on the client’s concerns so that 
decisions may be made on the focus of OT 
services from the evaluation to the intervention 
process.  

5. Island 

The island represents the successful 
identification of OPI arising from a shared 
decision-making and collaboration process 
between the client and the therapist. 
Determining the OPI with the client is a central 

principle in the provision of client-centered 
practice. Consequently, there will also be a 
greater sense of appreciation for the role of OT 
once OPIs have been identified together by the 
therapist, client, family, and others. 

 

Limitations. The BOAT model is limited to the 
OT processes of screening and gathering the 
client's subjective information, which involves 
the identification of OPI. Also, further research 
could elaborate on the barriers and facilitators of 
collaborative OPI between the client and the 
therapist, such as internal factors, skills, 
attitudes, and qualities, and how to address these 
factors, which could be explored further by 
another model.  

 

CONCLUSION AND RECOMMENDATIONS 

The BOAT model aims to address the client’s lack 
of knowledge on OT that leads to difficulties in 
formulating OPI, resulting in difficulties in 
engaging in the therapeutic process that affects 
the overall motivation and satisfaction in OT 
services. The model aims to promote a client-
centered approach where therapists provide 
understandable information to clients that will 
guide them to identify their own occupational 
issues. 

This model proposes the use of the buoys in 
order for the therapist to help the client assume 
an active role in identifying occupational 
concerns and to better understand OT. This 
model promotes a client-centered approach in 
which both the therapist and the client are active 
participants in decision-making throughout the 
entire OT process from evaluation up to 
intervention. Using the COPM can foster an 
appreciation of occupations, shifting the 
narrative to occupations and identifying 
occupational problems from the client’s 
perspective. Moreover, it is recommended to 
conduct further qualitative and quantitative 
research on using the model in practice. 
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